
High Coil Count Quality PU Foam

22

Reinforced Edge Aloe Vera

COMFORT CORE	 COSMETICS

• High count double 
knotted and tempered 
open coil spring unit for 
maximum support and 
durability


• Recommended for 100kg 
average per person


• 4mm Edge wire used for 
framing the open coil unit


• Breathable insulator pads 
acting as a buffer zone 
and allows for improved 
ventilation 


• High density foam layers 
promoting increased 
comfort and quality


• Pu Foam allow for even 
body weight distribution 
promoting pressure point 
relief


• Hypoallergenic, non toxic 
PU foam manufactured 
exclusive and in-house


• EPE foam corners and 
waves for better edge 
support


• Engineered as a turnable 
product for extended use 
and comfort


• A Quality anti bacterial 
Aloe Vera knitted fabric, 
highly breathable and 
luxurious to the touch


• Quilted and upholstered to 
promote comfort


• Non-allergenic fibres used 
in the quilt to promote 
hygiene and breathability


1Yr

Guarantee 

Warranty 

10Yr

Simunye Orthopaedic Firm


